


 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Press Briefing - Update on the implementation of the immediate and unconditional 
ceasefire agreement between Cambodia and Thailand 

11:00 AM, August 3, 2025 

Statement by H.E. CHUM Sounry, the Ministry of Foreign Affairs and International 
Cooperation Spokesperson: 

 

In response to the statement issued by the Thai Ministry of Foreign Affairs on 2 August 
2025, particularly its call for negotiations, the Ministry of Foreign Affairs and 
International Cooperation of the Kingdom of Cambodia reaffirms its unwavering 
commitment to the peaceful resolution of all outstanding issues with Thailand. This 
commitment is grounded in international law and the principles outlined in the 2000 
Memorandum of Understanding.  



 

Cambodia has taken note of Thailand’s call for negotiations and remains open to 
dialogue in good faith.  However, the Ministry regrets that certain assertions contained 
in the statement do not accurately reflect the situation on the ground. 

 

Cambodia calls on Thailand to match its words with concrete actions—by refraining 
from provocative measures, fully respecting the ceasefire agreement, and ensuring the 
humane treatment and prompt release of Cambodian military personnel currently under 
Thai control. 

 

Cambodia calls on Thailand to demonstrate a genuine commitment to the peace 
process by strictly adhering to the agreed legal framework, ceasing all unilateral 
actions, and engaging constructively in dialogue based on mutually recognized 
documents. Cambodia has consistently shown its readiness to engage in good-faith 
negotiations in pursuit of a peaceful resolution. 

 

Cambodia has fully committed to the implementation of the ceasefire agreement and 
remains open to sincere dialogue. We reaffirm our readiness to work closely with 
Thailand and relevant international partners to achieve a just, peaceful, and lasting 
resolution that serves the best interests of both nations and peoples. 

  



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Press Briefing - Update on the implementation of the immediate and unconditional 
ceasefire agreement between Cambodia and Thailand 

11:00AM, August 3, 2025 

  

Intervention by H.E. Pen Bona, Royal Government Spokesperson: 

 

On this occasion, as the Royal Government Spokesperson, I’d like to once again 
express my heartfelt gratitude to all compatriots, both at home and abroad, who have 
united in support of peace and of our soldiers and armed forces and have raised their 
voices to call on the Thai side to release our 18 soldiers and facilitate their return to the 
country. 

 



The voice of the Cambodian people, now resonating across the world, sends a clear 
message to the international community: Cambodia and its people seek to live in peace, 
free from all forms of aggression and violation. As a peace-loving nation, Cambodia 
does not invade or provoke any other country. What Cambodia firmly upholds is its 
sovereign right to defend its territorial integrity and to protect its honor and dignity 
against any form of invasion or disrespect. 

 

As all Cambodian people deeply understand in their hearts, peace is the identity of 
Cambodia under the leadership of the Techo-Thipadei era. Our leaders regard the peace 
achieved through Samdech Techo Hun Sen’s Win-Win Policy as more precious than 
anything else, a rare and invaluable achievement for Cambodia in the past 500 years.  

 

In this regard, I’d like to once again emphasize to all compatriots that the ceasefire, 
which officially took effect at midnight on 28 July 2025, is the result of our leadership’s 
sincere commitment to peace—strongly supported by leaders of major peace-loving 
nations who share our values. This ceasefire agreement has been warmly welcomed 
by numerous world leaders and is currently being implemented under the close and 
careful monitoring of the international community. 

  



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Press Briefing - Update on the implementation of the immediate and unconditional 
ceasefire agreement between Cambodia and Thailand 

11:00AM, August 3, 2025 

Keynote Address by H.E. LTG. Maly Socheata, the Ministry of National Defense 
Spokesperson: 

 

1. On 3 August 2025, the second round of the field inspection tour will be conducted by 
the ASEAN Defence Attaché Observer Group, currently led on an interim basis by the 
Malaysian Defence Attaché. The delegation includes representatives from six countries: 
Indonesia, Laos, Myanmar, the Philippines, Singapore, and Vietnam. The group will 
visit several key locations, particularly in Oddar Meanchey and Preah Vihear provinces, 
which have been among the areas most affected by the recent armed clashes between 



the Cambodian and Thai militaries, to observe the implementation of the ceasefire 
agreement. 

 

2. This field inspection tour follows the special meeting held on 28 July 2025 in 
Malaysia, which led to the ceasefire agreement and has since contributed to improved 
conditions along the border. During this visit, the ASEAN Defence Attaché Observer 
Group, currently led on an interim basis by the Malaysian Defence Attaché, will carry 
out its mission over a two-week period. The participation of these partner countries 
reflects a shared commitment to ensuring the ceasefire’s success and longevity, with 
the ultimate goal of restoring peace, stability, cooperation, and development for the 
benefit of the peoples of both nations. 

  



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Press Briefing - Update on the implementation of the immediate and unconditional 
ceasefire agreement between Cambodia and Thailand 

4:00PM, August 3, 2025 

  

Intervention by H.E. Pen Bona, Royal Government Spokesperson: 

 

On this occasion, as the spokesperson for the Royal Government, I would like to inform 
our fellow citizens, both at home and abroad, that throughout the implementation of 
the ceasefire agreement, the Royal Government, led by Samdech Moha Borvor Thipadei 
Hun Manet, continues to give the highest priority to both the frontlines and the rear. In 
particular, the Government prioritizes the formulation of policies to support our fallen 



and wounded soldiers, as well as to assist displaced civilians who have been evacuated 
from conflict-affected areas and relocated to safe zones. 

 

In particular, Her Excellency Dr. Pech Chanmony, the First Lady of Cambodia, has 
actively participated in memorial ceremonies honoring the fallen soldiers, visited 
wounded soldiers receiving treatment in hospitals, and met with evacuees in various 
safe shelter camps. At the same time, all of our national leaders, including Samdech 
Techo Hun Sen, President of the Senate; Samdech Kittipritth Bandit; Samdech Thipadei, 
the Prime Minister; and the First Lady of Cambodia, together with civil and military 
officials at all levels, have remained fully committed and tirelessly dedicated to carrying 
out their responsibilities. 

 

This active engagement clearly demonstrates our leadership’s deep commitment to 
peace, the welfare of our troops and armed forces, and the well-being of every citizen—
ensuring that no one is left behind. In conclusion, our leadership stands in unwavering 
solidarity with all members of the armed forces and shares the concerns of every citizen 
in all circumstances. 

  



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Press Briefing -Update on the implementation of the immediate and unconditional 
ceasefire agreement between Cambodia and Thailand 

4:00PM, August 3, 2025 

Keynote Address by H.E. LTG. Maly Socheata, the Ministry of National Defense 
Spokesperson: 

 

On August 3, 2025, the interim ASEAN Military Observer Group, comprising 
representatives from six countries—Indonesia, Laos, Myanmar, the Philippines, 
Singapore, and Vietnam—departed from Phnom Penh for Oddar Meanchey and Preah 
Vihear provinces. These areas have been affected by recent armed clashes between 
Cambodian and Thai forces. The mission is led by Colonel Nazlee Bin Abdul Rahim, the 
Malaysian Defence Attaché to Cambodia. The purpose of this two-week mission is to 
monitor the implementation of the ceasefire on the ground. This activity follows the 



outcome of the special meeting held on July 28, 2025, in Malaysia, which resulted in a 
mutual agreement on the ceasefire between the two sides. 

 

The participation of these partner countries reflects a shared commitment to ensuring 
the success and sustainability of the ceasefire, with the ultimate goal of restoring peace, 
stability, cooperation, and development for the people of both nations.  

 

As of now, 18 Cambodian military personnel remain in Thai custody following their 
capture at 7:50 AM on July 29, 2025. While two wounded personnel were returned to 
Cambodia on August 1, 2025, the remaining individuals have yet to be released. 

 

The Royal Government of Cambodia continues to call on the Thai side to promptly 
repatriate the remaining personnel in accordance with international humanitarian law. 
Cambodia remains actively engaged in serious negotiations to resolve this matter and 
has formally requested Malaysia, in its capacity as ASEAN Chair, to mediate and press 
the Thai authorities to expedite their return. The Ministry of National Defence and the 
Royal Cambodian Armed Forces firmly reaffirm that we will never abandon any of our 
military personnel under any circumstances. 

 


