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Press Briefing - Update on the implementation of the immediate and unconditional 
ceasefire agreement between Cambodia and Thailand 

  

7:00 AM, September 01, 2025  

  

Intervention by H.E. Pen Bona, Royal Government Spokesperson 

  

Cambodia: A Small Country with a Small Population but Gaining Widespread Support 
and Praise 
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Up until now, Cambodia has continued to value the ceasefire agreements and has 
respected this truce diligently. The ceasefire has remained in effect and continues to 
offer significant benefits to both parties (Cambodia and Thailand), particularly 
contributing to regional security and stability. 

  

Through sincerity, good faith, a peace-loving spirit, and adherence to international law, 
Cambodia has gained increasing recognition and praise on the international stage. As 
a small nation in Southeast Asia, Cambodia draws global attention through its active 
and principled diplomacy, led by Samdech Thipadei Hun Manet, Prime Minister, and 
SamdechTecho Hun Sen, President of the Senate, who have placed strong focus on 
the border dispute with Thailand and have swiftly conveyed Cambodia’s true position to 
the international community. 

  

Furthermore, the unity of the Cambodian people, both domestically and abroad, 
including Buddhist monks, has been actively engaged in demonstrating the peace-
loving spirit, respect for international law, and order, in which they demand that 
Thailand respect the ceasefire, cease provocations that lead to conflict, and prevent 
further escalation of hostilities. These efforts have garnered significant international 
interest in Cambodia. 

  

The unified voice of Cambodia, expressed by both its leaders and citizens, is clear: 
Cambodia loves peace, respects international law, and seeks peaceful borders, 
friendship, cooperation, and development. Cambodia does not desire armed conflict. 
These steadfast principles and actions have been acknowledged by the international 
community through diplomatic visits by ambassadors, the Interim Observers Team 
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(IOT), foreign officials, and journalists who have come to Cambodia, witnessed the 
reality on the ground, and helped convey the truth about Cambodia’s leadership and 
people to the world. 

  

In short, Cambodia, a small country with a small population, has received widespread 
support and praise from many countries worldwide. Nonetheless, the mission is not yet 
complete; we must continue to maintain this strong national unity to firmly support the 
government and our brave armed forces. 
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Press Briefing - Update on the implementation of the immediate and unconditional 
ceasefire agreement between Cambodia and Thailand    

  

4:00 PM, September 1, 2025   

  

Keynote Address by H.E. LTG. Maly Socheata, the Ministry of National Defense 
Spokesperson: 

  

This afternoon, I would like to provide an update on developments following the entry 
into force of the ceasefire between the Cambodian and Thai Armed Forces on July 28, 
2025, and the conclusion of the Extraordinary Meeting of the GBC on August 7, 2025, 
as of today: 
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1. Starting from 6:00 AM on the 1st of September, 2025, up to 3:00 PM this afternoon, 
the situation at the frontline, Military Region 4 and Region 5—Preah Vihear, Oddar 
Meanchey, and Banteay Meanchey Provinces—is currently calm with no new 
developments reported yet. Our military forces stand strong and are performing their 
duty with full vigilance in defending the country's sovereignty and territorial 
integrity.  The Royal Government, the Armed Forces, and the people of Cambodia stand 
firmly united and resolutely determined to defend our territorial integrity, national 
sovereignty, and dignity.  

  

2. Cambodia's Armed Forces reaffirmed its full commitment to the ceasefire agreement 
between the Cambodian and Thai Armed Forces reached at Putrajaya on July 28, 2025, 
and the 13-point agreed minutes adopted during the extraordinary meeting of the GBC 
held on August 7, 2025, with the observation of Malaysia, the United States of America, 
and the People's Republic of China.  

  

It should be noted that the ceasefire is widely welcomed and supported by the 
international community, reflecting the shared aspiration for peace in the region. 
Cambodia, as a highly responsible and peace-loving country, has been fully adhering 
to all terms of the ceasefire by resolving to dialogue and cooperation instead of 
confrontations and conflicts.  

  

Cambodia reaffirmed its stand to resolve the issue peacefully in good faith in 
accordance with international law, the UN Charter, and the ASEAN Charters. Cambodia 
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called on Thailand to honour all terms stipulated in the ceasefire agreement as well as 
the spirit of agreement during the Extraordinary GBC Meeting. 

  

In addition, Cambodia reiterated its firm and unequivocal commitment to upholding the 
spirit of the consensus agreed upon by both parties in the recent Extraordinary Meeting 
of the RBC, with both parties agreeing to increase confidence to de-escalate tensions 
and maintain peace along the border, using all necessary mechanisms to resolve 
differences peacefully and avoid clashes in the spirit of good neighborliness, friendship, 
and solidarity. And on the occasion when problems arise, both parties shall work 
together to resolve them through existing mechanisms. In this sense, Cambodia urged 
that Thailand adhere to the same spirit. 

  

3. At the same time, Cambodia continued to call on the Thai side to implement the 
above agreement and return 18 of our military personnel to Cambodia so they can 
reunite with their families, who have been waiting days and nights, every minute and 
every second, for their return. It is also important to note that Thai soldiers illegally 
captured this Cambodian military soldier immediately after the ceasefire took effect on 
the morning of 29 July 2025. As of 4:00 PM on 1 September 2025, their detention has 
lasted 34 days, 6 hours, and 10 minutes. 

  

The Ministry of National Defense, the Royal Cambodian Armed Forces, and the 
international community will continuously demand that Thailand uphold its 
obligationunder international law. We wish to underscore that we will never abandon 
or leave any one of our family members behind. Full implementation of the ceasefire 
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by both sides will increase a favorable atmosphere for restoring peace, stability, and 
normalcy to the friendship between our two countries. 

 


